



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017 MULTIPLE PRESERVES

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A1.	CAPTAIN DANIEL WRIGHT WOODS FOREST PRESERVE			
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	Clean Cut	Y	Y	\$194,300.00
2	McGinty	Y	Y	\$291,450.00
3	ENCAP	Y	Y	\$185,590.00
4	Homer	Y	Y	\$211,050.00
5	CARDNO	Y	Y	\$176,880.00
6				
7				
8				
9				

Chris Miller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

[Signature]  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE

8/25/17  
DATE



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017 MULTIPLE PRESERVES

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A2.	CUBA MARSH FOREST PRESERVE			
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	Clean Cut	Y	Y	\$96,350.00
2	ILM	Y	Y	\$107,212.11
3	Mc Garity	Y	Y	\$173,535.00
4	V3	Y	Y	\$83,310.00
5	Homer	Y	Y	\$92,600.00
6				
7				
8				
9				

Christina Muller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

Matthew Allen  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE

8/25/17  
DATE



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017 MULTIPLE PRESERVES

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A3. ETHEL'S WOODS FOREST PRESERVE				
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	Clean Cut	Y	Y	176,000.00
2	ILM	Y	Y	\$91,225.20
3	Mc Ginty	Y	Y	\$178,800.00
4	Homer	Y	Y	\$182,000.00
5	Tallgrass	Y	Y	\$187,600.00
6				
7				
8				
9				

C. Donaten Miller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/25/17  
DATE

Matthew Miller  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017 MULTIPLE PRESERVES

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
A4.	FOURTH LAKE FOREST PRESERVE			
1	Clean cut	Y	Y	\$60,800.00
2	ILM	Y	Y	\$45,673.92
3	Mc Ginty	Y	Y	\$69,664.00
4	Kinnucan	Y	Y	\$83,400.00
5	Homer	Y	Y	\$70,288.00
6	CARDNO	Y	Y	\$44,800.00
7	Tallgrass	Y	Y	\$88,960.00
8				
9				

Christine Miller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

Matthew Uff  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE

8/25/17  
DATE



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A5. GRANT WOODS FOREST PRESERVE						
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	AES	Y	Y	1	<del>\$</del> 9,395.33	<del>\$</del> 110,649.22
2	Clean Cut	Y	Y	1	<del>\$</del> 15,360.00	<del>\$</del> 103,680.00
3	ILM	Y	Y	1	<del>\$</del> 25,344.00	<del>\$</del> 111,191.84
4	McGinty	Y	Y	1	<del>\$</del> 30,976.00	<del>\$</del> 127,296.00
5	ENCAP	Y	Y	1	<del>\$</del> 13,440.00	<del>\$</del> 168,192.00
6	V3	Y	Y	1	<del>\$</del> 29,568.00	<del>\$</del> 122,112.00
7	Kinnucan	Y	Y	1	<del>\$</del> 23,040.00	NO BID
8	Homer	Y	Y	1	<del>\$</del> 15,360.00	<del>\$</del> 132,480.00
9	CARDNO	Y	Y	1	NO BID	<del>\$</del> 115,200.00

Christ Miller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/25/17  
DATE

Miller  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A5. GRANT WOODS FOREST PRESERVE						
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
10	Tallgrass	Y	Y	1	\$28,160.00	\$122,496.00
11				1		
12				1		
13				1		
14				1		
15				1		
16				1		
17				1		
18				1		

Chris Muller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/25/17  
DATE

Matthew Wolfe  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE



BID TALLY SHEET

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017 MULTIPLE PRESERVES

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A6.	GREENBELT FOREST PRESERVE			
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	Clean Cut	Y	Y	<del>\$</del> 112,000.00
2	ILM	Y	Y	\$ 98,624.05
3	Mc Ginty	Y	Y	<del>\$</del> 160,300.00
4	ENCAD	Y	Y	\$ 106,750.00
5	Kinnocan	Y	Y	<del>\$</del> 67,445.00
6	Homer	Y	Y	\$ 110,250.00
7	Tallgrass	Y	Y	<del>\$</del> 139,125.00
8				
9				

Chris Muller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/25/17  
DATE

Matt Miller  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017 MULTIPLE PRESERVES

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A7.	LAKELWOOD FOREST PRESERVE SCHREIBER LAKE			
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	Native Restoration Services	Y	Y	\$51,744.00
2	AES	Y	Y	\$46,591.62
3	Clean Cut	Y	Y	\$60,192.00
4	ILM	Y	Y	\$46,749.96
5	JH Landworks	Y	Y	\$39,877.20
6	McGinty	Y	Y	\$73,333.92
7	ENCAP	Y	Y	\$68,134.00
8	Kinnucan	Y	Y	\$87,704.00
9	Homer	Y	Y	\$56,012.00

Crist Miller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/25/17  
DATE

Miller  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE





**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017 MULTIPLE PRESERVES

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A7. LAKEWOOD FOREST PRESERVE SCHREIBER LAKE				
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
10	CARDNO	Y	Y	\$ 54,720.00
11	Tallgrass	Y	Y	\$ 38,874.00
12				
13				
14				
15				
16				
17				
18				

Chris Miller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/25/17  
DATE

Matthew Miller  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A8.	VAN PATTEN WOODS FOREST PRESERVE					
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	Clean Cut	Y	Y	1	\$19,800	\$107,820.00
				2	\$13,420	
2	ILM	Y	Y	1	No BID	\$88,847.40
				2	\$15,997.50	
3	Mc Ginty	Y	Y	1	\$8,283.60	\$144,414.00
				2	\$14,762.00	
4	Homer	Y	Y	1	\$7,200.00	113,680.00
				2	\$5,040.00	
5				1		
				2		
6				1		
				2		
7				1		
				2		
8				1		
				2		
9				1		
				2		

Christ Miller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/25/17  
DATE

Mattie Allen  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017 MULTIPLE PRESERVES

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A9.	WADSWORTH SAVANNA FOREST PRESERVE			
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	Clean Cut	Y	Y	\$94,695.00
2	McGinty	Y	Y	\$91,003.50
3				
4				
5				
6				
7				
8				
9				

Christ Miller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/25/17  
DATE

Matthew Wolfe  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE



**BID TALLY SHEET**

PROJECT: WOODY INVASIVE PLANT CLEARING – WINTER 2017

BID #: 18002

BID OPENING DATE: August 25, 2017 @ 10:00 a.m. local time

A10.	WOODLAND HABITAT RESTORATION PHASE 3 CLEARING PROJECT					
REF. NO.	VENDOR	BID BOND Y/N	ACK ADD Y/N	BID ALT REF. NO.	BID ALTERNATE(S) AMOUNT	BASE BID AMOUNT
1	Clean Cut	Y	Y	1	\$67,840.00	\$152,988.00
				2	\$3,200.00	
2	Kinmucan	Y	Y	1	\$142,500.04	411,212.00
				2	NO BID	
3	Homer	Y	Y	1	\$80,560.00	\$258,252.00
				2	\$4,000.00	
4				1		
				2		
5				1		
				2		
6				1		
				2		
7				1		
				2		
8				1		
				2		
9				1		
				2		

Christ Miller  
PURCHASING REPRESENTATIVE

8/25/17  
DATE

Matthew Allen  
WITNESS

8/25/17  
DATE